
                         SUPPLY CHAIN MANAGEMENT DIVISION
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                         INVITATION TO TENDER NUMBER 25-101
                          Lighting Upgrades - Phase I 

Lamarche Electric Inc. City Wye'd Electric Four-O-One Electric 
Ltd.

Duplex Enterprises 
Limited

1663587 Ontario Inc. 
o/a Arc & Spark 

Electric

Gannon/Blackburn 
Electric Inc.

Power-Tek Electrical 
Services Inc.

Broder Electric Ltd. C&M Electric Ltd Droogh Electric Ltd. Wired Synergy Inc. Earl Carr Electric 
Canada Ltd

Drycore Electric Inc KE Electrical Ltd.

School Name/ Bid Price

Chapman Mills P.S. No Bid $ 1,145,000.00 $ 1,095,279.87 $ 1,144,966.00 $ 1,419,000.00 $ 999,532.00 $ 1,094,000.00 $ 1,313,000.00 $ 1,088,800.00 $ 1,360,000.00 $ 1,194,000.00 $ 1,190,000.00 No Bid $ 1,088,750.00

Fielding Drive P.S. No Bid $ 720,000.00 $ 1,167,052.25 $ 660,400.00 $ 929,700.00 $ 655,092.00 $ 587,000.00 $ 835,000.00 $ 669,800.00 $ 888,000.00 $ 787,000.00 $ 695,000.00 $ 715,000.00 No Bid

Sawmill Creek P.S. No Bid $ 1,211,000.00 $ 1,213,656.00 $ 1,054,560.00 $ 1,241,800.00 $ 887,590.00 $ 1,100,000.00 $ 1,445,000.00 $ 1,255,800.00 No Bid $ 1,396,000.00 $ 1,249,000.00 No Bid $ 1,350,000.00

Sir Wilfrid Laurier S.S. $ 1,354,299.00 $ 1,288,000.00 $ 1,595,881.15 No Bid $ 1,253,300.00 $ 1,077,054.00 $ 1,132,000.00 $ 1,585,000.00 $ 1,171,800.00 No Bid $ 1,373,000.00 $ 1,321,000.00 No Bid $ 1,290,000.00

* These bid results are intended for information purposes only and do not consitute an award of any bid.  Further evaluation will be conducted by staff.

** The OCDSB requires the awarded contractor to submit 50% Performance Bond and 50% Labour and Materials Payment Bond for every project where the tendered price is equal to or greater than $500,000 per site.

*** Prices are HST extra

****All cash allowances are included in the stipulated bid price


